. CITY OF
____‘ FALCON HEIGHTS

2077 W. LARPENTEUR AVENUE FALCON HEIGHTS, MN 55113 - 5694 PHONE 612-644 - 5050

October 23, 1987

TO: Mayor Baldwin and Council Members
FROM: Ja
RE: Coundil Meeting 10-28-87

I am scheduled to return from the ICMA Conference in Montreal on Wednesday, October
28 on a NW Flight (the only one available) scheduled to arrive at 6:10 P.M. so I
am sure I will not be back in time for the special closed meeting at 6:30 P.M. Tim
Marx is aware of this and will be prepared to cover what he needs to with you.

I will only have carry-on baggage and I'm being picked up so hopefully I'll make it
by 7:00. (Looking at the agenda, if I'm five minutes late I may miss the entire
meeting!)

Hopefully I'll see you Wednesday night.

(P.S. If I'm late you can take it up with Jerry!)

JRW/kn

HOME OF THE MINNESOTA STATE FAIR AND THE U OF M INSTITUTE OF AGRICULTURE
—
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CITY OF FALCON HEIGHTS
COUNCIL AGENDA

" OCTOBER 28, 1987
. CALL TO ORDER: 7:00 P.M.
B. ROLL CALL: CHENOWETH WALLIN HARD CIERNIA BALDWIN
WIESSNER ATTORNEY ENGINEER SECRETARY

C. APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF OCTOBER 14, 1987/

ACTION:

D. PUBLIC HEARINGS: NONE.
E. CONSENT AGENDA:

1. Fire and Ambulance Reports

2. Disbursements through October 28, 1987 $68,174.23
3. Payroll 10/1/1987 - 10/15/87 $ 9,282.25
4. Briggs & Morgan Statement through September 30, 1987

5. Prosecutor's Statement for Jume, July and August, 1987

6. Ramsey County Sheriff's Report for September, 1987

7. Licenses

F. REPORTS, REQUESTS AND RECOMMENDATIONS:

1. Appointment of Lizabeth L. Boger, 1469 W. Idaho, to Human Rights Commission

ACTION:

2. Consider Sale of 1982 Ford Squad Car

ACTION:

G. ANNOUNCEMENTS AND UPDATES:

H. ADJOURNMENT:

ACTION:




MINUTES
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING
OCTOBER 14, 1987

‘ Baldwin opened the meeting at 7:00 P.M.

ALL MEMBERS PRESENT

Hard, Ciernia, Chenoweth, Wallin, and Baldwin. Also present were Wiessner
and S. Chenoweth.

MINUTES OF SEPTEMBER 23, 1987 APPROVED
Council approved the Minutes of September 23, 1987.

CONSENT AGENDA APPROVED
Council approved the Comnsent Agenda as presented.

1. Disbursements through October 14, 1987 $28,013.61

2. Payroll 9/16/87 - 9/30/87 $ 6,987.58

3. Fire & Rescue Reports .

4. Planning Commission Minutes of October 5, 1987

5. Human Rights Commission Minutes of September 17, 1987

6, 1987 Audit Proposal from George M. Hansen Co., P.A.

7. Maier, Stewart & Assoc. Statement through September 19, 1987
8. Licenses

‘ PRESENTATION BY ALAN STEDMAN, COMMUNITY SCHOOL COORDINATOR AT F.H. SCHOOL

. Alan Stedman presented Council with information on his personal background
and explained his responsibilities and goals as Coordinator.

REQUEST FROM CIATTI'S RESTAURANT, 1611 W. LARPENTEUR, FOR PRORATION OF
LIQUOR LICENSE FEE

Council considered a letter from Ciatti's Italian Restaurant dated
September 22, 1987, requesting the license fee for the liquor license be
prorated due to the fact that the restaurant will not be in operation for
an entire year (opening is planned for November 23rd). Following input
from Dan Danforth, President of Ciatti's, and Council discussion, Wallin
moved, seconded by Chenoweth, approval of the liquor and Sunday liquor
licenses on a prorated basis for a total fee of $2,800. Motion carried
unanimously.

APPROVAL OF VARIANCE REQUEST FROM GARY LANGER, 1740 SIMPSON, TO PLACE A
UTILITY SHED FOUR FEET FROM NORTH LOT LIKNE

Council approved Mr. Langer's request as unanimously recommended by the
Planning Commission at their October 5, 1987 meeting.

APPROVAL OF 1988 POLICING CONTRACT WITH BAMSEY COURTY SHERRIF'S DEPARTMENT

Ciernia explained he has reviewed the formula used for calculating the
cost of the contract and found there is possibly one area in which a

. reduction might be negotiated (dispatching service is based on population
which includes the University and the Sheriff's Department does not police
the University). Any changes in this area would also affect the city's
joint policing contract vith Lauderdale. Council approved the 1988
policing contract and authorized Baldwin and Wiessner to sign the same.
Wiessner was directed to pursue possible future cost reductions with

e




MINUTES
OCTOBER 14, 1987
PAGE 2

Ramsey County and the City of Lauderdale.
COUNCIL MEETING STANDING RULES APPROVED

Ciernia presented the revised draft ofthe standing rules, after which
Council made minor changes and approved the document.

CITY TO ISSUE RFP FOR SELECTION OF CITY'S LEGAL COUNSEL

Council discussed the process recommended by Wiessner for selecting the
city's legal services, made some minor changes, and directed Wiessner to
proceed with mailing a request for proposal to interested legal firms.

ALLEY UPDATE - BETWEEN LARPENTEUR AND CALIFORNIA, HAMLINE TO ALBERT

Wiessner informed that Progressive Contractors, Inc. has begun repair work
on the alley drainage.

PAYMENT TO RAMSEY COUNTY FOR REMAINDER OF HAMLINE AVENUE CONSTRUCTION
COSTS AUTHORIZED

Ciernia moved, seconded by Chenoweth, final payment to Ramsey County to
complete the city's obligation for the reconstruction of Hamline Avenue,
Hoyt to Larpenteur, and the alley. Motion carried unanimously.

$200.00 DONATION TO PARK BUGLE AUTHORIZED

Hard moved authorization of a $200.00 donation to the Park Bugle. Motion
carried unanimously.

CITY TO CONTRACT FOR ANIMAL CONTROL WITH CITY OF NEW BRIGHTON

Wallin moved approval of the animal control contract with the City of New
Brighton as recommended by Wiessner. Motion carried unanimously.

ADJOURNMENT

Chenoweth moved adjournment at 9:20 P.M. Motion carried unanimously.

Tom Baldwin, Mayor

ATTEST:

Janet R. Wiessner, Clerk Administrator
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' e CITY OF PALCON HEIGHTS Agenda Ttem: | |

REQUEST FOR COUNCIL CONSIDERATION )

1TEM DESCRIPTION:

Fire Department Reports

SUBMITTED BY: Terry Iverson

REVIEWED BY:
—_— Leo Lindig

EXPLANATION/SUMMARY (attach additional sheets as necessary)?

v FALCON HEIGHTS FIRE DEPARTMENT CALLS -

. 1 __ Fire Calls
4 Rescue Calls

1 False Alarms
6 TOTAL

LAUDERDALE

3 Fire Calls
Rescue Calls
False Alarms
TOTAL

|




FALCON HEIGHTS FIRE DEPARTMENT

Eore COMPANY FIRE REPORT
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Ist Line/Laid From _ To. Length Ft. Gals. Water Delivered
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2nd Line/Laid From _ To Length _Ft. Gals. Water Delivered
Size of Size of
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Extra Pressure Ordered By. Hose laid Total Feel
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FALCON HEIGHTS FIRE DEPARTMENT ——
COMPANY FIRE REPORT
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P, FALCON HEIGHTS

form 105~

FIRE DEPARTMENT

COMPANY FIRE REPORT
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FALCON HEIGHTS FIRE DEPARTMENT

Rescve COMPANY FIRE REPORT -
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—_ FALCON HEIGHTS FIRE DEPARTMENT
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FALCON HEIGHTS FIRE DEPARTMENT —
COMPANY FIRE REPORT
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FALCON HEIGHTS FIRE DEPARTMENT
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FALCON HEIGHTS FIRE DEPARTMENT

Form 105
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FALCON HEIGHTS FIRE DEPARTMENT
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Paid Fegister Page 1
City of Falcon Heights

23 Oct 1987 .
Fri 10:46 MM

e’

e ¢ e (¢

vt

-t

N

Pay Pay
Check Employee Employee Pay 6roup Sroup Check
Number Number  Name Period Nusber Description Check Amount Date Status
0160£5 0 0.00 15-Oct-87 VOID
016016 0 0.00 15-Oct-87 VOID
016017 000000002 Wiessner, Janet R. 19 o1 semi-monthly 995,80 15-Oct-87 OQutstanding
016018 000000006 Bianchi, David P. 19 o semi-wonthly 58,00 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016019 000000007 Bianchi, Joseph D. 19 01 semi-monthly 163.50 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016020 000000008 Brown, Raymord F. 19 o1 semi-monthly 318.60 15-0ct-87 Dutstanding
016021 000000011 Chenoweth, Shirley B. 19 01 semi-sonthly £40.81 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016022 000000018 Holmgren, John M. 19 01 semi-monthly 100.50 15-Oct-87 Quistanding
016023 000000020 Iverson, Terry D. 19 01 sesi-wonthly 986,33 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016024 000000022 LeMay, Dennis E. 19 01 semi-wonthly 140, 16 15~Dct-87 Outstanding
016025 000000024 Lindig, Leo 19 01 semi-wonthly 136.50 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016026 000000027 Morgan, Jay M. 19 01 semi-wonthly 593,95 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016027 000000031 Rolek, Alan J. 19 01 semi-monthly £76.18 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016028 000000033 Schauffert, Craig F. 19 )| semi-wonthly 79.15 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016029 000000036 Vainovskis, Victor 19 01 semi-monthly 32,50 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016030 000000038 Wright, Vincent D. 19 01 semi-wonthly 775.15 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016031 000000041 Neumann, Hristine L. 19 01 semi-monthly 280.76 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016032 0 0.00 15-Oct-87 VOID
016033 000000003 Baumarn, Nicholas B. 10 02 monthly 1 441,28 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016034 000000005 Berndt, Ross 10 02 wonthly 1 208.20 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016035 000000003 Bush, Patti J. 10 02 monthly 1 140,00 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016036 000000013 Clarkin, Michael D. 10 02 monthly 1 67.50 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016037 000000015 Dowdell, Ralph L. 10 02 monthly 20.29 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016038 000000016 Fuller, James D. 10 02 monthly 1 221,50 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016039 000000019 Houck, Arn M. 10 02 monthly 1 67.25 15-0ct-67 Outstanding
016040 000000021 Kurhajetz, Clement M. 10 02 wonthly 1 275.75 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016041 000000023 LeMay, Douglas 10 02 monthly 1 131.11 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016042 000000025 McDermond, Cindy K. 10 0 wonthly 1 55.37 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016043 000000026 McNabb, Gerald 10 02 wonthly 1 223,31 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016044 000000028 Dlsen, Ernest D. 10 02 wonthly 1 212.25 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016045 000000029 Olson, Joseph E. 10 02 monthly 1 124,29 15-0ct~87 Outstanding
016046 000000032 Schasfer, Richard A. 10 02 wonthly 1 133.75 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016047 000000034 Ssida, Bail 10 02 wmonthly 266,75 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016048 000000039 Morgan, Jay 10 02 wonthly 1 213.50 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016049 000000040 Kayser, Douglas 10 02 wonthly 1 138.75 15-0ct-87 Outstanding
016050 000000044 Blanchard, Patricia M. 10 02 monthly 1 77.90 15-Oct-87 Outstanding
016051 000000045 6ilbert, Jerome J. 10 02 monthly 1 34,65 15-0ct-87 OQutstanding
016052 000000046 Holmgren, John H. 10 02 monthly 1 251.00 15-0ct-B87 Outstanding

Grand Total

9,262.25
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DovoLas L. SxoB LAW OFFICES Jaxzs G. Rax Teg®Y L S1YE

Micpazy H. Jspomiuvs frbcmng H. MaRTIN mm;n;.' w;::n
R. Scott DaviEs aupy J. Halis Many M. DyYRS
J.P;mcxucnnrrr B R 1 G G S AN D M O R GA N Maxy L.IPPEL Parmick M. GamEY
Joms B. VAN DE RorTH, JB. Jawes A.VosE Trmorey E. MaBX
Ricmaxp G. MARE PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION RopYx L. HANSEN CuErYL A THOXAS

C. SELDEN RoperT E. WooDS Kxvin A BERC

‘Awpzew C. BECBER Wiriam J. JOAN1S MaRE SCEBOEDEE
Jeyrrxy J. KEYBS Mancarer K. SAVAGE M. Brioip ‘McDoNoUOE
Jaxxs E. NELSON 2200 FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING By G. BrusLE MasuaN M.

. Jamoxs A.GEIS Towy sE-mnnonn Cmsmli;lln (. CLEVELAND
STEVE A.BRAND Mapy E. SCBAFFNER Naxcy D. Amxiso¥
Jori H.GOTTESMAN SAINT PAUL, MINNESOTA BoIOL MicuagL H. STREATER MicHAEL J. MCELLISTREM
Arax H.Macun Jons H. LINDSTBOM PavL S. JACOBSEN
Jxrreey F. Sma® Ricmaxp D. ARDEBSON Ngal T. BOETHE
MarreEW L. LEVITT TELE—PHONE (B12) op1-1216 Sa11Y A. ScoooIN TrmorEy J. KeEe®
Davip G. GREENING gmm Cwn):,l)mlu.o m RS Fesges UTLLO
Dastzs Bt CovomLe TELECOPIER (©12) 222~ aomn m"’:',,wm,w" s 1. OsTEY
Joserr P. NoacE ANpREW R. KINTZINOER Kzvin J. BINIEER
Coames R, Haxvos FxeoEmick P. ANGST Ropxet D. SicoLt
Awpeea M. Bo¥D Rossxr L. 122 Burs J. KRLMAF
Toworay P. FLARBRTY A HuxTRODS VINCENT A, THOMAS
Mawrx B Fist INCLUDING THE FORMER FIRM OF EiizaneTs J. ANDEEWS
Romert J. PRATTE GrxooRY J. STENMOE
Jomx BULTERA 1LEVITT, PAIMER, BOWEN, ROTMAN & SHARE Caamzs B. ROGERS OF COUNSEL

.‘J‘.lﬂm Mg Kns
ICHARD E.
octOber 15 ’ 1987 JomN M. PALMER
SamuxL H. MOBOAX
Fravx N, GRARAM
A.LAURENCE Davis
G. FRAME

Ms. Jan Wiessner

City Clerk—Administrator

city Hall Building

2077 West Larpenteur Avenue
Falcon Heights, Minnesota 55113

Re: 987 General Matters

1987 General Fe——=—=

Dear Jan:

Enclosed please find our statement for services for the
months of August and September. 1 missed 2 month of billing as
a result of some confusion that occurred in our Business office
since I took primary responsibility for performing the City's
civil legal work.

Wwe have not pbilled you for the amount of time (approximately
4 hours) which Mark schroeder and 1 devoted to pbringing me fully
up-to-date on the city's jegal matters. From now On, 1 will be
submitting pills to Yyou monthly. if you would 1like any change

in the format of the bills or require additional jnformation,
please just let me know .

Sincerely Yyours:

s

rimothy E. Marx

TEM: jc
Attachment

cc: John B. van de North, Jr.
v:007

2200 FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING
SAINT PAUL, MINNESOTA 85101

2400 1DS CENTER
MINNEAPOLLS, MINNESOTA 354082




In Account With
BRIGGS anp MORGAN FILENO1529.596D TEM

. PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
2200 FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING

SBAINT PAUL, MINNESOTA 55101

TELEPHONE (612} 201-1216

October 15, 1987

City of Falcon Heights

2077 West Larpenteur Avenue
Falcon Heights, Minnesota 55113
Att: Ms. Shirley Chenoweth

PLEASE DETACH TOP PORTION AND MAIL WITH PAYMENT

Re: 1987 General Matters
File No. 1529.596D _.

For professional services provided
in connection with the following matters
through September 30, 1987:

4

DATE ATTORNEY TIME __  DESCRIPTION

8/03/87 Schroeder .30 Telephone conference with Marx
regarding Stratford condos;
telephone conferences with Jan

Wiessner regarding truck
purchase.
8/03/87 Marx ‘ .50 Review Development Agreement;

conference with Tony Stemberger
regarding Stratford Investment
Project.

8/04/87 Schroeder .20 Telephone conference with Kevin
Berg regarding mechanics 1lien
on Bullseye; telephone call

to Jan Wiessner.

8/04/87 Berg .25 Review Dismissal Stipulation;
telephone conference with
Attorney Fram regarding status.

8/04/87 Marx .50 Review Municipal Contracting
‘ Law regarding truck purchase;
telephone conference with Jan

‘ Wiessner.

BRIGGS anp MORGAN
F. 30025 FED. 1.D. #41-0954702

e




October 15,

1987

City of Falcon Heights
Att: Ms Shirley Chenoweth

PAGE TWO.

in Account With

BRIGGS anp MORGAN

FILENO.]1529 596D

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

2200 FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING

SAINT PAUL, MINNESOTA 353101

TELEPHONE (6122) 201-1215

TEM

8/05/87

8/05/87
4
8/06/87
8/06/87
8/07/87

8/07/87

8/10/87

. 30025

PLEASE DETACH TOP PORTION AND MAIL WITH PAYMENT

Marx

Marx

Schroeder

Carlson

Marx

Marx

Marx

.25

.50

.20

.25

1.00

Telephone conference with Jan
Wiessner and Tim Welch
regarding Stratford Homes.

Telephone conference with Jan
Wiessner and Mark Schroeder
regarding contracting issue;
miscellaneous related matters
regarding City Attorney.

Review dutch elm letter;
telephone conference with Cindy
Carlson regarding Roselawn
Avenue Easement, stipulation
of fact.

Telephone conference with Title
Company regarding Abstracts;
telephone conference with Mark
Schroeder.

Review Certificate; telephone
conference with Mr. Welch
regarding Stratford Investors.

Draft Bullseye Release; review
with Mark Schroeder; telephone
conference with Jan Wiessner;
meeting with Mark Schroeder
regarding general matters.

Prepare Certificate and cover
letter to Jan Wiessner re:
Stratford.

BRIG S anp MORGAN

FED. L.D. #41-0054702



. In Account With
' BRIGGS anp MORGAN FLENO. 1529.596D TEM

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
‘ 2200 FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING

SAINT PAUL, MINNESOTA 35101

TELEPHONE (812) 201-1215

October 15, 1987

City of Falcon Heights
Att: Ms Shirley Chenoweth

PAGE THREE.

PLEASE DETACH TOP PORTION AND MAIL WITH PAYMENT

8/10/87 Schroeder .25 Conference with Cindy Carlson
regarding Roselawn Easements,
Abstract of Title.

8/10/87 Carlson .25 Conference with Mark Schroeder;
telephone conference with Title
, Company regarding Abstract.

8/11/87 Marx .25 Telephone conference with
Council Executive Secretary;
follow-up on Roselawn Easement
Agreement status.

8/12/87 Marx .50 Determine status of Roselawn
Easement; telephone conferences
with Cindy Carlson and Mike
McEllistrem regarding same.

8/12/87 Marx .50 Review Welch correspondence;
letter to Jan Wiessner
regarding Stratford Project.

8/12/87 Carlson 4.00 Title Examination; draft
opinion.
8/13/87 Marx .25 Follow-up meeting with Cindy

Carlson and Mike McEllistrem
regarding Roselawn Easements.

8/13/87 Marx .25 Letter to Jan Wiessner
regarding proposed
Redevelopment Agreement
Amendment.

BRIGGS anp MORGAN
F. 30025 , FED. 1.D. #41-0954702




. In Account With
' BRIGGS anp MORGAN FILENO. 1529.596D TEM

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
. 2200 FIRBT NATIONAL BANK BUILDING
SAINT PAUL, MINNESOTA §85101

TELEPHONE (612} 201-1215

October 15, 1987

City of Falcon Heights
Att: Ms Shirley Chenoweth

PAGE FOUR.

PLEASE DETACH TOP PORTION AND MAIL WITH PAYMENT

8/14/87 McEllistrem .75 Conference with Cindy Carlson;
letter to Jan Wiessner.

8/14/87 Van de North .50 Conference with Jan Wiessner
regarding = Stratford Office
Park.

!/14/87 Carlson 1.00 Conference McEllistrem
regarding Title Opinion.

8/17/87 Marx 2.00 Meeting with Jan Wiessner.

8/23/87 Schroeder .10 Review McEllistrem letter
regarding Roselawn Easements;
message to Tim Marx regarding
University of Minnesota
abstract.

8/24/87 Marx 1.00 Review Coffman documents
regarding streetlight request;
review Council agenda;
telephone conference with Jan
Wiessner.

8/24/87 Marx 2.50 Review documents; review
Attorney Welch's proposal
amendment; meeting with Tony
Stemberger; telephone
conference with Attorney Welch.

8/24/87 Stemberger 1.25 Conference with Tim Marx:
telephone conference with Tim
Welch regarding amendments as

‘ to guaranty regarding
Stratford.

BRIGGS Axp MORGAN
F. 30025 ‘ FED. 1.D. #41-0954702



in Account With
BRIGGS anp MORGAN FILENO. 1529.596D TEM

PROFESSIONAL ABSOCIATION
2200 FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING
SAINT PAUL, MINNESOTA 55101

TELEPHONE (612) 201-1215

October 15, 1987

City of Falcon Heights
Att: Ms Shirley Chenoweth

PAGE FIVE.

PLEASE DETACH TOP PORTION AND MAIL WITH PAYMENT

8/27/87 Marx 1.00 Telephone conferences with Tim
Welch; review documents;
meeting with Jack Van de North.

8/27/87 Van de North .25 Conference with Tim Marx and
Tim Welch regarding 1666
Coffman.

8/28/87 Stemberger .45 Conference with Tim Marx
regarding funding of escrow
regarding 1666 Coffman.

8/28/87 Marx 1.50 Review 1666 Coffman documents;
telephone conference with North
Star State Bank; telephone
conference with Minnesota Title
Insurance; meeting with Tony
Stemberger.

8/31/87 Marx 1.75 Telephone conference with Bank
attorney, Developer and Jan
Wiessner regarding Escrow
Agreement regarding 1666
Coffman.

9/01/87 Marx 2.50 Meeting with Jan Wiessner and
other City staff; revise
Bullseye Agreement.

9/01/87 Marx .50 Telephone conference with Jan
Wiessner; telephone conference
with Tim Welch regarding 1666

. Coffman.

BRIGGS anp MORGAN
F. 30025 FED. L.D. #41-0954702



in Account With
BRIGGS anp MORGAN FILENO. 1529,596D TEM

. PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

1525.596D TEM

2200 FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING
SAINT PAUL. MINNESOTA 353101

TELEPHONE (612) 201-1215
October 15, 1987

City of Falcon Heights
Att: Ms Shirley Chenoweth

PAGE SIX.

PLEASE DETACH TOP PORTION AND MAIL WITH PAYMENT

9/02/87 Schroeder .10 Review Bullseye Agreement
regarding sprinkler system.

9/03/87 Marx 2.50 Redraft Escrow Agreement;
telephone conferences with
Association officials and Jan
Wiessner.

- 9/04/87 Marx 1.00 Review and drafting documents
regarding 1666 Coffman.

9/04/87 Marx .50 Telephone conference with Jan
Wiessner; review letter
regarding Mortgage Servicing
Agreement; review transcript
regarding Stratford.

9/07/87 Marx 1.00 Review Council Agenda; review
letter from O'Connor & Hannan
and bond documents; letter to
Jan Wiessner regarding action
required.

9/08/87 Marx _ .50 Review letter and redraft of
Escrow Agreement regarding 1666
Coffman.

9/09/87 Marx .25 Finalize and revise Escrow
Agreement.

9/11/87 Marx .50 Telephone conference with Mr.
Lindberg and Mr. Klepp
. regarding 1666 Coffman.

BRIGGS anp MORGAN
F. 30025 FED. 1.D. #41-0954702



. . In Account With
' BRIGGS anp MORGAN FILENO. 1529.596D TEM

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
2200 FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING
SAINT PAUL. MINNESOTA 35101

TELEPHONE (612} 201-1215

October 15, 1987

City of Falcon Heights
Att: Ms Shirley Chenoweth

PAGE SEVEN.

PLEASE DETACH TOP PORTION AND MAIL WITH PAYMENT

9/11/87 Marx .25 Telephone conference with City
Finance Director Al Rolek.

9/14/87 Marx 1.00 Telephone conferences with
Shirley Chenoweth; draft

’ Release for Stowman matter.
~9/15/87 Marx .75 Meeting with Jan Wiessner,
Shirley Chenoweth and Al Rolek.

9/18/87 Carlson 2.00 Investigate property where
easement lies at Ramsey County
Courthouse.

9/21/87 Carlson 1.00 Review legal description
regarding location of
registered property.

9/22/87 Marx .50 Review City Council Agenda;
telephone conference with Jan
Wiessner.

9/22/87 Carlson 2.00 Conference with Diane Ablan;

check property at Courthouse
(Torrens or Abstract).

9/22/87 Ablan .50 Conference with Cindy Carlson
regarding legal description
for Easement.

9/23/87 Schroeder .30 Telephone conferences with
Shirley Chenoweth and Jack Van
de North regarding Kutzik

. appraisal hearing (Renchin

testimony).

BRIGGS anp MORGAN
F. 30025 ~ FED. L.D. #41.0954702



oy . In Account With
~ BRIGGS anp MORGAN FiLeno. 1529.596D TEM

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
2200 FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING
BAINT PAUL. MINNESOTA §3101

TELEPHONE (612) 201-1216

October 15, 1987

City of Falcon Heights
Att: Ms Shirley Chenoweth

PAGE EIGHT.

PLEASE DETACH TOP PORTION AND MAIL WITH PAYMENT

9/24/87 Schroeder .10 Telephone conference with Jack
Van de North regarding Kutzik.

9/30/87 Schroeder .10 Telephone conference with Noel
regarding Kutzik appraisal

' hearing.

SUBTOTAL: ~ — — — = - $3,687.50

DISBURSEMENTS:

Duplicating $ 136.40

Delivery Charges $ 57.50

Abstracting Fees $..120.00 - - = = = = = = = - - - - - - - $ 313.90

TOTAL DUE THIS STATEMENT: - - - $4,001.40

HOURLY RATES FOR THE MATTERS BILLED
IN THIS STATEMENT:

Van de North = 1.25 hours at $90.00 per hour = §$ 112.50
Marx - 30.00 hours at $90.00 per hour = $ 2,700.00
Schroeder ~ 1.65 hours at $80.00 per hour = § 132.00
Stemberger - 1.70 hours at $90.00 per hour = § 153.00
McEllistrem - .75 hours at $90.00 per hour = $ 67.50
Berg - .25 hours at $90.00 per hour = $ 22.50
Carlson = 10.50 hours at $45.00 per hour = $ 472.50
Ablan - .50 hours at $55.00 per hour = § 27.50
V:005

BRIGGS anp MORGAN
F. 30025 , FED. 1.D. #41.0054702




Peterson, Franke & Riach Statements

Prosecuting Services:

June, 1987 $ 1,072,23
July, 1987 885.75
August, 1987 1,062.75

$ 3,020.73




PETERSON, FRANKE & RIACH

JEROME E. FRANKE EVERETT L. PETERSON
' WARREN E. PETERSON PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION (1903-1982)
RONALD J. RIACH
JEROME 5. FIILA 200 ROSEDALE TOWERS * ALSO ADMITTED
DANIEL WITT FRAM 1700 WEST HIGHWAY 36 IN WISCONSIN
GLENN A. BERGMAN SEVILLE MINNE _—
JOHN MICHAEL MILLER RO ' SOTA 35113 - ST. PAUL OFFICE
CASS S. WELL* '_ 300 MIDWEST FEDERAL BUILDING
PETER L ST. PETER, C.P.A. (612) 636-6400 50 BAST FIFTH STREET
TIMOTHY J. HASSETT ST. PAUL, MINNESOTA 35101
MICHAEL T. OBERLE (612) 291-8955
WILIAM A. SCHMIDT, M.D.
BRIAN B. ELKINGTON OF COUNSEL
JAMES D. PHILLIPS C. WILLIAM FRANKE

CLYDE C. AHLQUIST
MOILLY T. SHIELDS

October 13, 1987

Ms, Janet R. Wiessner

Clerk Administrator

City of Falcon Heights

2077 West Larpenteur Avenue
Falcon Heights, Minnesota 55113

Re: Statement for Legal Services
June, July, August 1987

Jan:

1987. You will notice a dramatic change in the form of the billing document. I
am hopeful that this will provide the city with more useful information
regarding prosecution services. There is a billing document for each
prosecution and each document itemizes work done by various people within our
firm by date.

, I am enclosing billing statements for the months of June, July and August

I am requesting that the City of Falcon Heights prepare one check for the
monthly total. I have highlighted in yellow the individual totals and have
included a tape for the total of all individual prosecutions in a particular
month. The prosecution bills for the month of June inadvertently contained
information that had been billed in the month of May. Therefore, there are
same corrections on the June billing statements. -

Jim Phillips, an attorney; will be handling most of the court and pretrial
appearances on traffic matters. I will appear in connection with ordinance
violations, gross misdemeanors and jury trials.

Regina Walsh and Virginia Dippel are paralegals who have input on wvarious
investigative and trial preparation aspects of the prosecutions. Since June
many of the things which I formerly did are now being done by paralegals. The
attorney time is being billed at the rate of $42.50 per hour. The paralegal
time, is being billed at the rate of $30.00 per hour. This has resulted in a
savings to the city since June of 1987.

I am proposing that the hourly rates for attomeys be increased to $55.00 per
hour commencing December 1, 1987. I believe the increased attorney rate will
be offset by the fact that paralegals can do a fair amunt of work at a lesser

‘ hourly rate. I would be happy to discuss this matter with you and/or the city
council at your convenience.




' Ms. Janet R. Wiessner
October 13, 1987
Page 2

If you have any questions, please contact me.
Very truly yours,
PETERSON, FRANKE & RIACH

City of Falcon Heights
JF/4

, Enclosures

P. S. Incidentally, the reverse side of the billing document contains billing
information which is not applicable to the City of Falcon Heights. We do not
intend to charge financing costs to the city.
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OATE OF ISSUE 10707787
TINE 0818

33 FALCON HEIGHTS

01 CRIMIAL MONICIOE

02 FORCIBLE RAPE

03 ROBBERY

04 ASSAULTY :

05 BURGLARY-RESIDENCE

06 BURGLARY-NON RES

07 BURGLARY-ATTENPTED

08 BURGLARY~POSSIBLE

09 THEFT-OVER $50

10 THEFT-UNDER $50 -

11 THEFT=-ATTENPTED

12 THEFT-POSSIBLE

13 AUTO THEFT-RECOVERED -

14 AUTO THEFT-ATTEMPYTED

15 AUTO THEFT=-POSSIBLE

16 ARSON

17 FORGERY & C-FEITING

18 FRAUD

19 EMBEZZILEMENT

20 STOLEN PROPERTY=-BUY
STOLEN PROPERTY-REC
ABOUCTION
"VANDALISN

s WEAPONS

5 PROSTITUTION & VICE

26 SEX OFFENCE

2T NARCOTIC DRUG LANS

28 GAMBLING

29 OQFFENSE~FAN & CLORN

30 DRIVING UNDER INFLUE

31 LIQUOR LAWS

32 DISORDERLY CONDUCT

33 VAGRANCY

34 ALL OTHER OFFENSES

50 ACC=PROPERTY DAMAGE

51 ACC-PERSONAL INJURY

;52 ACC~FATAL

53 STREET LIGHTS

564 ALARNS

55 ANINALS (OTHERS)
56 ASSIST A CITIZEM
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DATE OF ISSUE 10/07/87
TINE o818

FALCON HEIGHTS

BOATING & SWIMMING
BREATHALYZER

DOA®'S

008's

006 COMPLAINTS
DOMESTIC

EMERGENCY

FIRE

Louo

MISSING PERSONS
PROWLER

RECOVERED PROPERTY
SEARCH WARRANTS
SNOWMOBILES
SUSPICIOUS COMPLAINT
TRAFFIC.
MISCELLANEOQUS

TOTAL

-
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RAMSEY COUNTY B
SHERIFFS INCIDENT REPORTING SYSTEM

REPORT BY INCIDENT WITHIN CTTY FOR PERIOD
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CONSENT AGENDA

October 28, 1987

General Contractors

Cragg Signs, Inc. #1302
7150 Madison Avenue West
Golden Valley, MN 55427

Industrial Sprinkler Corporation #1304
2366 Rose Place
Roseville, MN 55113

The Quimby Company #1307

2173 Energy Park Drive
St. Paul, MN 55108

Refuse Hauler

Poor Richard's Incorporated #1303
1114 East Jessamine
St. Paul, MN 55106
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gonsent Meeting Date:10-28-87

Palacy ¥ Agenda Item: F2

CITY OF FALCON HEIGHTS

REQUEST FOR COUNCIL CONSIDERATION

ITEM DESCRIPTION:

Sale of 1982 squad car.

SUBMITTED BY: Vincent Wright

REVIEWED BY: Jan Wiessner

EXPLANATION/SUMMARY (attach additional sheets as necessary):

Jim Fuller has offered to buy the old (old) squad and radio for $500.00. Vince
’ checked with Ramsey County and a car dealer and this appears to be a fair price.

The "o0ld-01d" squad has not been used since we retired the "old" squad. It is
just taking up space.

(See attached memo from Vince)

ACTION REQUESTED:

Sell 1982 squad car to Jim Fuller with the understanding that
he accept it "as is".

¢

)

6/29/87




CITY OF

FALCON HEIGHTS

2077 W. LARPENTEUR AVENUE FALCON HEIGHTS, MN 55113 - 5594 PHONE 612-644-5050

October 22, 1987

TO: Jan Wiessner
FROM: Vincent Wright
RE: Jim Fuller purchasing the "old' squad car.

Jim Fuller would like to buy the old squad car for $500,00. I have talked to
Ramsey County and they said the cars go on auction and they sell for $400.00

to $600.00 depending on their condition. The Ford is not in too good of condi-
tion. I do not think $500.00 is too bad of an offer. He would like the old
radios also. They are no good except for parts. Midway Ford gave an estimate
of $400.00 - $500.00.

VW/kn

. T
HOME OF THE MINNESOTA STATE FAIR AND THE U OF M INSTITUTE OF AGRICULTURE
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Consent Meeting Date:10-28-87

P.)' X Agenda Item: Fl
—— CITY OF FALCON HEIGHTS EEEE——

REQUEST FOR COUNCIL CONSIDERATION

ITEM DESCRIPTION:

Appointment of Lizabeth Boger to Human Rights Commission

SUBMITTED BY:

Tom Baldwin

Tom Baldwin
REVIEWED BY: Human Rights Commission

Shirley Chenoweth

EXPLANATION/SUMMARY (attach additional sheets as necessary) !

. The Human Rights Commission recommends Ms. Boger's appointment.

Attachment:

(1) Application from Ms. Boger

ACTION REQUESTED:

Approve appointment as recommended by Human Rights Commission.

®




' FALCON HEIGHTS COMMISSION/COUNCIL APPLICATION &7/\ W

pate (f t[87 . W.// fﬂﬁ(;?
g [zabbeth L. 'BOger e ¢
ADDRESS: Hq W. Tdaho  Falcths nW 55j08PRNE (o4, -850
HOW LONG AT ABOVE ADDRESS? [ YEARS |

IN WHAT CAPACITY DO YOU WISH T0 SERVE? ./ (upéuld Dikp X y4hiie Q0 o






